

PRICING PAGE A
TRIDENT DIVE EQUIPMENT

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	MFG	MFG ITEM #	TOTAL QTY	Great American Diving Co 07/02/12	Dive Rescue Intl. 07/03/12	Grainger 07/06/12	Tom's Dive & Swim 07/09/12
1	Large knife, Underwater Kinetics Hydra-alloy Blue tang blunt end 4 1/2" Blade (yellow)	Trident	KN78	7	105.29	84.23	NO BID	99.00
2	Scissors, Heavy duty with nylon carry case & D-ring (yellow)	Trident	KN25	5	12.90	10.32	NO BID	9.50
3	Pony bottle holder kit 13 cubic feet tank 4.4" diameter tank	Trident	TA 33	5	123.33	98.66	NO BID	123.00
4	Weight belt, 2" X 58" nylon/web with stainless steel buckle	Trident	WB26	5	10.55	8.44	NO BID	9.50
5	Retractor compass with snap	Trident	D718	5	42.87	33.99	NO BID	41.00
6	Dive Duffle bag, 16"x30" Ballistic mesh and cordura	Trident	GB10	5	25.16	20.12	NO BID	25.00
7	Snorkel keeper, Neoprene, soft	Trident	RP00	10	1.73	1.38	NO BID	1.50
8	Oring kit - Deluxe, 40 O-Rings, Plastic case w/ silicone	Trident	D602	5	8.04	6.43	NO BID	7.40
9	Multi Tool - SCUBAMASTER® TOOL	Trident	DA66	5	23.10	18.48	NO BID	20.00
10	Air Pressure Tool - Plug in type intermediate pressure checker	Trident	SA09	2	44.28	35.41	NO BID	43.00
11	Dive Reel - Large divers "RATCHET" reel w/ 250 ft. nylon line	Trident	DF98	2	41.79	33.43	NO BID	41.00
12	Gear Keeper - Retractable, R545 RT3-0083 Brass Snap Clip	Trident	R545	6	21.75	17.10	NO BID	20.60
13	6" Chem light stick (Blue)	Trident	DA76	6	2.07	1.60	NO BID	1.50
14	6" Chem light stick (Pink)	Trident	DA76	6	2.07	1.60	NO BID	1.50
15	New extra duty super shears	Trident	KN01	2	27.81	22.25	NO BID	23.00
16	Tank Gauge - pressure checker 5000 psi	TRIDENT	SA08	5	83.43	66.74	NO BID	83.00
					576.17	460.18		549.50

COMMENTS: