+. STATE OF MISSOURI
.«‘,\ OFFICE OF ADMINISTRATION

S ) BID RECORD BID NO PAGE
HP1300002 REV [ 1 OF 2

BID SPECIFICATIONS

Mustang Dry Suits: MSD577SR, MSD624, & MSD576; various sizes. *Notified immediately upon issuance of initial RFQ

that Mustang had discontinued the 577SR. Some stock available on shelves.* Further information stated 624 as

replacement - not yet in production. Toward end of quote cycle was informed that 576 would be an almost identical match

to 577. 576 also not yet in production. Included all three in RFQ. It was determined that we would only buy the 577 at this
VENDOR LIST

2.
SAFETY & FIRE EXCHANGE LFS INC Z.j XL Suzed
TOM'S DIVE & SWIM DIVE RESCUE INTERNATIONAL
5 6
GRAINGER

BID SOLICITED VIA

OpHone [Orax XE-mMAL O maiL [ CATALOG COMPARISON [ OTHER
BID RESPONSE

COMPANY

VENDOR NO RESPONSE DATE

TOM'S DIVE & SWIM 7426715970-1 07/21/2012

PERSON CONTACTED TELEPHOMNE NO. BID TYPE

WARREN ROSEBERRY 512-451-3425 UpHoNe [JrFax XEe-malL OMAIL [0 cATALOG

ITEM NO. BIDDER'S BRAND OR DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE ITEM TOTAL

MSD577SR - DISCONTINUED, NO BID
MSD624 - ADD $100/SUIT FOR 3XL SIZE 9 $ 1.199.0000 $10,791.00
MSD576 - ADD $78/SUIT FOR 3XL SIZE 9 $ 959.0000 $ 8,631.00

FOB DELIVERY BID TOTAL

[J SHIPPING X DESTINATION $19.422.00

BID RESPONSE
COMPANY

VENDOR NO RESPONSE DATE

DIVE RESCUE INTERNATIONAL 8409167890-0 07/23/2012

PERSON CONTACTED TELEPHONE NO BID TYPE

BRIAN DERRINGTON 800-248-3483 [JPHONE [JFAX E-MAIL [ImaiL [JcaTALOG

ITEM NO. BIDDER'S BRAND OR DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE ITEM TOTAL

MSD577SR - MUSTANG STOCK: 4-S;1-M;2-2XL;2-3XL 9 $ 1,885.0800 $ 16.965.72
MSD624 9 $ 2,329.5500 $ 20,965.95
MSD576 9 $ 1,695.5600 $ 15,260.04

FOB DELIVERY BID TOTAL

[ SHIPPING X] DESTINATION $53,191.71

BID RESPONSE

COMPANY

VENDOR NO. RESPONSE DATE

GRAINGER 3611502801-L 07/23/2012

PERSON CONTACTED TELEPHONE NO. BID TYPE

ZACH PARKER 573-239-6566 OpHoNe [JrFax XEe-mAL (OMAIL [ CATALOG

ITEM NO, BIDDER'S BRAND OR DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE ITEM TOTAL

MSD477SR - SMALL 2 $ 988.3700 $1.976.74
MSD577SR - MEDIUM 2 $ 988.7400 $1,977.48
MSD577SR - LARGE 1 $ 988.7600 $988.76
MSD577SR - XL *SEE NEXT PG FOR MORE PRICING 1 $988.7700 $988.77

FOB DELIVERY BID TOTAL

[J SHIPPING X DESTINATION $5.931.75

I HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THE BID(S) INDICATED ABOVE ARE CORRECT AS STATED AND THAT | HAVE NOT REVEALED A BIDDER'S
BID TO ANY OTHEB_QIQ‘I\DER OR PERSON.

A“AM DPS/MO STATE HIGHWAY PATROL 07/25/2012
I'Es S&(enlu@f Tk BIHDI3D00007 _ PDTIA HPD23 et

MO 300-0162N (8-81)
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eI " BID RECORD CONTINUATION
BID RESPONSE

COMPANY

GRAINGER - CONTINUED

BID NO

HP1300002

PAGE

OF 2

VENDOR NO RESPONSE DATE

PERSON CONTACTED TELEPHOMNE NO BID TYPE
OpHoNE [OFax OemalL OOmaiL [ cATALOG
ITEM NO. BIDDER'S BRAND OR DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE ITEM TOTAL
MSD577SR - 2XL 1 $988.78 $ 988.78
MSD577SR - 3XL 1 $ 1.087.64 $ 1,087.64
MSD624: SIZES SMALL - 2XL 9 $ 1,275.00 $ 11.475.00
MSD624: SIZE 3XL 1 $1.279.00 $1,279.00
FOB DELIVERY BID TOTAL
[J SHIPPING X DESTINATION $ 14,830.42

BID RESPONSE

COMPANY

LFS INC

VENDOR NO. RESPONSE DATE

9108229280-0 07/20/2012
PERSON CONTACTED TELEPHONE NO. BID TYPE
CYNTIA FLORA 800-426-8860 OpHoNE [OOrFax X E-mAL OOmaiL [ cATALOG
ITEM NO. BIDDER'S BRAND OR DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE ITEM TOTAL

MSD577SR: STK @ MUSTANG; 4-S,1-M;8-L;2-2XL 9 $ 966.00 $ 8,694.00
MSD577SR: SIZE 3XL 1 $ 1.063.00 $ 1.063.00
MSD576; SIZES M - 2XL 9 $ 959.00 $ 8.631.00
MSD624; SIZES XS-2XL: SIZE 3XL @ $1279.00 9 $ 1.159.00 $10,431.00

FOB DELIVERY BID TOTAL

[J sHIPPING X DESTINATION $ 28.819.00

BID RESPONSE

COMPANY

SAFETY & FIRE EXCHANGE

VENDOR NO. RESPONSE DATE

3311242840-0 07/20/2012
PERSON CONTACTED TELEPHONE NO. BID TYPE
JOE PETERS 314-481-7233 OpHone OFax Xe-mail OOmaiL [ caATALOG
ITEM NO. BIDDER'S BRAND OR DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE ITEM TOTAL
MSD577SR - STK @ MUSTANG; SIZES M-2XL 9 $ 975.00 $8.775.00
MSD624; SIZES SMALL - 2XL 9 $1,279.00 $ 11,511.00
MSD624; SHORT & TALL SIZES - ADD 5%
MSD576; SIZES MED - 2XL _ **SZ > 2XL ADD 10% 9 $990.00 $8,910.00
FOB DELIVERY BID TOTAL
L] SHIPPING X DESTINATION $ 29,196.00

BID RESPONSE

COMPANY

VENDOR NO. RESPONSE DATE

PERSON CONTACTED TELEPHOMNE NO BID TYPE
OpHoNe O Fax Demar Omar OcaTaLOG
ITEM NO. BIDDER'S BRAND OR DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE ITEM TOTAL
FOB ) DELIVERY BID TOTAL
[J sHIPPING (] DESTINATION

MO 300-1791N (8-01)



